

BID 20-45 /TAPPING SLEEVES W/ MJ OUTLETS  
 Bid Opening: May 13, 2020  
 Contract Term: 7/23/2020 thru 7/31/2022

PM: Brian Bobbitt

#	Items	Size of Main	Outside Diameter Range	Outlet Size	Est. Qty	Ferguson Waterworks		Hayes Pipe Supply		Core & Main		Mueller Co. LLC		Total Piping Solutions, Inc. (1)		
						UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	UnitPrice	TotalCost	
<b>1</b>																
#1-1	1500064	6 Inch	6.90 - 7.20	4 inch	6	\$ 438.59	\$2,631.54	\$ 441.5	\$2,649.00	\$ 493.61	\$2,961.66	\$ 752.86	\$4,517.16	\$ 468.98	\$2,813.88	
#1-2	1500066	6 inch	6.90 - 7.20	6 inch	55	\$ 476.6	\$26,213.00	\$ 479	\$26,345.00	\$ 506.44	\$27,854.20	\$ 800.92	\$44,050.60	\$ 522.9	\$28,759.50	
#1-3	1500084	8 inch	8.99 - 9.30	4 inch	30	\$ 471.61	\$14,148.30	\$ 473.5	\$14,205.00	\$ 513.5	\$15,405.00	\$ 771.89	\$23,156.70	\$ 502.09	\$15,062.70	
#1-4	1500086	8 inch	8.99 - 9.30	6 inch	30	\$ 405.62	\$12,168.60	\$ 515	\$15,450.00	\$ 554.87	\$16,646.10	\$ 818.58	\$24,557.40	\$ 557.01	\$16,710.30	
#1-5	1500088	8 inch	8.99 - 9.30	8 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 679	\$0.00	\$ 727.45	\$0.00	\$ 896.86	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
#1-6	1500108	10 inch	11.10 - 11.40	8 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 760.39	\$0.00	\$ 735.72	\$0.00	\$ 979.65	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
#1-7	1501204	12 inch	13.20 - 13.50	4 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 513.7	\$0.00	\$ 660.54	\$0.00	853.19	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
#1-8	1501206	12 inch	13.20 - 13.50	6 inch	50	\$ 577.1	\$28,855.00	\$ 579.99	\$28,999.50	\$ 672.26	\$33,613.00	944.32	\$47,216.00	\$ 634.54	\$31,727.00	
#1-9	1501208	12 inch	13.20 - 13.50	8 inch	10	791.31	\$7,913.10	\$ 797	\$7,970.00	\$ 872.75	\$8,727.50	\$ 1,026.78	\$10,267.80	\$807.57	\$8,075.70	
#1-10	1501212	12 inch	13.20 - 13.50	12 inch	2	\$ 1,294.13	\$2,588.26	\$ 1,303.5	\$2,607.00	\$ 1,344.53	\$2,689.06	\$ 1,171.35	\$2,342.70	\$ 1,144.52	\$2,289.04	
#1-11	1501604	16 inch	17.40 - 17.80	4 inch	4	603.94	\$2,415.76	\$ 608	\$2,432.00	\$ 899.51	\$3,598.04	\$ 1,087.88	\$4,351.52	\$672.43	\$2,689.72	
#1-12	1501606	16 inch	17.40 - 17.80	6 inch	4	\$ 660.89	\$2,643.56	\$ 665	\$2,660.00	\$ 902.02	\$3,608.08	\$ 1,134.29	\$4,537.16	\$ 744.95	\$2,979.80	
#1-13	1501608	16 inch	17.40 - 17.80	8"	4	\$ 842.71	\$3,370.84	\$ 849	\$3,396.00	\$ 1,027.63	\$4,110.52	\$ 1,267.0	\$5,068.00	\$ 975.27	\$3,901.08	
#1-14	1501613	16 inch	17.40 - 17.80	12"	5	\$ 1,312.91	\$6,564.55	\$ 1,322.0	\$6,610.00	\$ 1,679.83	\$8,399.15	\$ 1,494.94	\$7,474.70	\$ 1,398.46	\$6,992.30	
#1-15	1502008	20 inch	21.60 - 22.06	8 inch	4	\$ 873.63	\$3,494.52	\$ 880.24	\$3,520.96	\$ 1,045.47	\$4,181.88	\$ 1,303.28	\$5,213.12	\$ 1,455.75	\$5,823.00	
#1-16	1502112	20 inch	21.60 - 22.06	12 inch	1	\$ 1,370.68	\$1,370.68	\$ 1,381.04	\$1,381.04	\$ 1,792.71	\$1,792.71	\$ 2,330.29	\$2,330.29	\$ 1,691.13	\$1,691.13	
#1-17	1502016	20 inch	21.60 - 22.06	16 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 3,994.0	\$0.00	\$ 5,945.92	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
#1-18	1502406	24 inch	25.80 - 26.32	24 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 6,350.25	\$0.00	\$ 9,695.44	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
#1-19	1503132	30 inch	32.00 - 32.40	12 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 2,335.35	\$0.00	\$ 9,989.22	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
<b>2</b>																
#2-1	1503066	6 inch	6.91 - 7.40	6 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 479	\$0.00	\$ 506.44	\$0.00	\$ 801.88	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
#2-2	1503086	8 inch	9.11 - 9.68	6 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 515	\$0.00	\$ 554.87	\$0.00	\$ 563	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
#2-3	1503088	8 inch	9.11 - 9.68	8 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 679	\$0.00	\$ 727.45	\$0.00	\$ 899.9	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
#2-4	1503106	10 inch	11.24 - 12.24	6 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 564.92	\$0.00	\$ 595.4	\$0.00	\$ 924.25	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
#2-5	1503108	10 inch	11.24 - 12.24	8 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 760.39	\$0.00	\$ 737.72	\$0.00	\$ 1,033.24	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
#2-6	1503128	12 inch	13.44 - 14.20	8 inch	0	No Bid	\$0.00	\$ 797.29	\$0.00	\$ 882.75	\$0.00	\$ 1,069.35	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid	
TOTAL ESTIMATED COSTS								\$114,377.71		\$118,225.50		\$133,586.90		\$185,083.15		\$129,515.15
MANUFACTURER							Approved Mfg.		Ford Meter Box		Romac SSTIII		Mueller		Total Piping Solutions, Inc.	

(1) Total Piping Solutions, Inc. failed to submit the signed Bidder's Proposal therefore deemed non responsive. The disqualification of this bid did not effect the outcome of the bid.