

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
 Bid 16-127 / Propylene Glycol
 Bid Opening Date: July 27, 2016
 Bid Estimate \$60,095.00.00

Awardee: PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc.

Buyer: Robin Heitz

Project Manager: David Collier

BIDDERS		PVS Nolwood Chemicals, Inc.		Southern Water Treatment Services		KOST USA Inc.		Brenntag Mid-South		Chemical Resources, Inc.		Univar USA Inc.	
Quantity (gallon)	Previous Unit Cost	Unit Cost (gallon)	Total Cost	Unit Cost (gallon)	Total Cost	Unit Cost (gallon)	Total Cost	Unit Cost (gallon)	Total Cost	Unit Cost (gallon)	Total Cost	Unit Cost (gallon)	Total Cost
8500	\$7.07	\$6.37	\$54,145.00	\$6.74	\$57,290.00	\$6.89	\$58,565.00	\$6.90	\$58,650.00	\$7.47	\$63,495.00	No Bid	No Bid
Manufacturer		KOST USA		Huntsman		KOST USA Inc.		Brenntag Mid-South		Monument Chemical		No Bid	
Bid Signed		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		No Bid	
Total Cost		\$54,145.00		\$57,290.00		\$58,565.00		\$58,650.00		\$63,495.00		No Bid	

Planholders not submitting bids: Industrial Solutions, LLC, Jeserie V. Samaniego, Lykins Energy Solutions, and Umicore Marketing Services, Inc.