

" Final Bid Tab"

			BIDDERS									
			Wilson Equipment Company		Rudd Equipment		Wayne Supply Company		Hertz Equipment		CMC	
Description	Est. Qty. (Two Years)		Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total
<b>SECTION A</b>												
<b>ITEM 1:</b>	<b>Backhoe/loader - dig depth 14' 5" minimum with 12", 18" or 24" bucket as needed.</b>											
9000138	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$190.00	\$380.00	\$220.00	\$440.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000139	Weekly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$650.00	\$1,300.00	\$550.00	\$1,100.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000140	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$2,400.00	\$1,850.00	\$3,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000141	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$1,140.00	\$198.00	\$2,376.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000142	Relocation Fee	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>ITEM 2:</b>	<b>Backhoe/loader w/extendable stick - dig depth 18' min. w/12" or 18" or 24" bucket as needed.</b>											
9000143	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$190.00	\$380.00	\$230.00	\$460.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000144	Weekly Rate	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$650.00	\$3,900.00	\$690.00	\$4,140.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000145	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$2,400.00	\$1,850.00	\$3,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000146	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$1,900.00	\$198.00	\$3,960.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000772	Relocation Fee	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>ITEM 3:</b>	<b>Hydraulic Hammer for backhoe w/1,000 foot pound impact strength.</b>											
9000148	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$200.00	\$400.00	\$175.00	\$350.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000149	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$800.00	\$3,200.00	\$690.00	\$2,760.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000150	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$2,400.00	\$1,095.00	\$2,190.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000773	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$198.00	\$3,168.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000151	Relocation Fee	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total	<b>Total Section A</b>			<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$19,800.00</b>		<b>\$28,344.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY  
 BID 15-90 / Heavy Equipment Rental  
 Bid Opening Date: June 24, 2015  
 Base Bid Estimate (2 Years): \$ 390,000

		<b>BIDDERS</b>										
		Wilson Equipment Company		Rudd Equipment		Wayne Supply Company		Hertz Equipment		CMC		
Description	Est. Qty. (Two Years)	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	
<b>SECTION B</b>												
<b>ITEM 4:</b>	Skid steer loader (rubberized track type only) w/attachments: forks, bucket, broom and asphalt milling drum as needed.											
<b>4A</b>	Operating capacity 2,200 lbs.											
9000774	Daily Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$875.00	\$3,500.00	\$205.00	\$820.00	\$235.00	\$940.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000775	Weekly Rate	6	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,560.00	\$9,360.00	\$700.00	\$4,200.00	\$645.00	\$3,870.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000776	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,490.00	\$6,980.00	\$1,500.00	\$3,000.00	\$1,775.00	\$3,550.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000777	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	24	No Bid	No Bid	\$410.00	\$9,840.00	\$95.00	\$2,280.00	\$198.00	\$4,752.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000778	Relocation Fee	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$9,840.00	\$0.00	\$95.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>4B</b>	Operating capacity 3,200 lbs.											
9000157	Daily Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$205.00	\$820.00	\$240.00	\$960.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000158	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$700.00	\$2,800.00	\$695.00	\$2,780.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000156	Monthly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,500.00	\$6,000.00	\$1,695.00	\$6,780.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000160	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$2,280.00	\$198.00	\$4,752.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000161	Relocation Fee	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00		
<b>ITEM 5:</b>	Landscape Rake with attachment for skid steer machines											
9000162	Daily Rate	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$570.00	\$30.00	\$180.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000163	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$300.00	\$1,200.00	\$70.00	\$280.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000164	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$795.00	\$1,590.00	\$300.00	\$600.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000165	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	24	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$198.00	\$4,752.00	No Bid	No Bid
9000166	Relocation Fee	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Section Total</b>					<b>\$0.00</b>	<b>\$29,680.00</b>		<b>\$25,560.00</b>		<b>\$34,196.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>

			BIDDERS									
			Wilson Equipment Company		Rudd Equipment		Wayne Supply Company		Hertz Equipment		CMC	
Description	Est. Qty. (Two Years)		Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total
<b>SECTION C</b>												
<b>ITEM 6:</b>	<b>Compact excavator - Rubberized tracks</b>											
<b>6A</b>	<b>Dig depth 7' - Weight 3,400 lbs.</b>											
9000779	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$250.00	\$500.00	\$145.00	\$290.00	\$145.00	\$290.00	\$148.00	\$296.00
9000780	Weekly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$550.00	\$1,100.00	\$500.00	\$1,000.00	\$545.00	\$1,090.00	\$450.00	\$900.00
9000781	Monthly Rate	0	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$0.00	\$1,000.00	\$0.00	\$1,325.00	\$0.00	\$1,350.00	\$0.00
9000782	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	8	No Bid	No Bid	\$410.00	\$3,280.00	\$95.00	\$760.00	\$198.00	\$1,584.00	\$100.00	\$800.00
9000783	Relocation Fee	0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$0.00	\$100.00	\$0.00
<b>6B</b>	<b>Depth 10' - Weight 7,500 lbs.</b>											
9001073	Daily Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$350.00	\$1,400.00	\$200.00	\$800.00	\$165.00	\$660.00	\$180.00	\$720.00
9000173	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$800.00	\$3,200.00	\$700.00	\$2,800.00	\$605.00	\$2,420.00	\$540.00	\$2,160.00
9000172	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$1,200.00	\$2,400.00	\$1,350.00	\$2,700.00	\$1,620.00	\$3,240.00
9000174	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	20	No Bid	No Bid	\$410.00	\$8,200.00	\$95.00	\$1,900.00	\$198.00	\$3,960.00	\$100.00	\$2,000.00
9000177	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$410.00	\$820.00	\$95.00	\$190.00	\$99.00	\$198.00	\$100.00	\$200.00
<b>6C</b>	<b>Depth 12' - Weight 12,000 lbs.</b>											
9000178	Daily Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$375.00	\$1,500.00	\$250.00	\$1,000.00	\$220.00	\$880.00	\$259.00	\$1,036.00
9000179	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$825.00	\$3,300.00	\$900.00	\$3,600.00	\$620.00	\$2,480.00	\$779.00	\$3,116.00
9000180	Monthly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,200.00	\$8,800.00	\$1,300.00	\$5,200.00	\$1,695.00	\$6,780.00	\$2,340.00	\$9,360.00
9000181	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	24	No Bid	No Bid	\$410.00	\$9,840.00	\$95.00	\$2,280.00	\$198.00	\$4,752.00	\$100.00	\$2,400.00
9000182	Relocation Fee	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$410.00	\$1,640.00	\$95.00	\$380.00	\$99.00	\$396.00	\$100.00	\$400.00
<b>ITEM 7:</b>	<b>Hydraulic Track excavator - w/bucket: 24", 36" and 42" as needed</b>											
<b>7A</b>	<b>Depth 14' - Reach 22' Weight 18,000 lbs.</b>											
9000183	Daily Rate	8	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$285.00	\$2,280.00	\$275.00	\$2,200.00	\$355.00	\$2,840.00
9000184	Weekly Rate	16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,050.00	\$16,800.00	\$835.00	\$13,360.00	\$1,066.00	\$17,056.00
9000185	Monthly Rate	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,000.00	\$24,000.00	\$2,595.00	\$31,140.00	\$3,195.00	\$38,340.00
9000186	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$6,840.00	\$258.00	\$18,576.00	\$125.00	\$9,000.00
9000187	Relocation Fee	16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$1,520.00	\$99.00	\$1,584.00	\$125.00	\$2,000.00
<b>7B</b>	<b>Depth 19' - Reach 28' Weight 28,000 lbs.</b>											
9000188	Daily Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$750.00	\$3,000.00	\$330.00	\$1,320.00	\$400.00	\$1,600.00	\$420.00	\$1,680.00
9000189	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,400.00	\$5,600.00	\$1,300.00	\$5,200.00	\$1,200.00	\$4,800.00	\$1,260.00	\$5,040.00
9000190	Monthly Rate	6	No Bid	No Bid	\$3,500.00	\$21,000.00	\$2,600.00	\$15,600.00	\$3,595.00	\$21,570.00	\$3,780.00	\$22,680.00
9000191	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	28	No Bid	No Bid	\$695.00	\$19,460.00	\$145.00	\$4,060.00	\$258.00	\$7,224.00	\$200.00	\$5,600.00
9000192	Relocation Fee	10	No Bid	No Bid	\$695.00	\$6,950.00	\$145.00	\$1,450.00	\$99.00	\$990.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00
<b>7C</b>	<b>Depth 23' - Reach 35' Weight 44,000 lbs.</b>											
9000193	Daily Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$850.00	\$3,400.00	\$500.00	\$2,000.00	\$535.00	\$2,140.00	\$585.00	\$2,340.00
9000194	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,100.00	\$8,400.00	\$1,800.00	\$7,200.00	\$1,595.00	\$6,380.00	\$1,755.00	\$7,020.00
9000195	Monthly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,500.00	\$22,000.00	\$4,400.00	\$17,600.00	\$4,695.00	\$18,780.00	\$5,265.00	\$21,060.00
9000196	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	24	No Bid	No Bid	\$775.00	\$18,600.00	\$145.00	\$3,480.00	\$258.00	\$6,192.00	\$200.00	\$4,800.00
9000197	Relocation Fee	8	No Bid	No Bid	\$775.00	\$6,200.00	\$145.00	\$1,160.00	\$99.00	\$792.00	\$200.00	\$1,600.00

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY  
 BID 15-90 / Heavy Equipment Rental  
 Bid Opening Date: June 24, 2015  
 Base Bid Estimate (2 Years): \$ 390,000

			<b>BIDDERS</b>										
			Wilson Equipment Company		Rudd Equipment		Wayne Supply Company		Hertz Equipment		CMC		
Description	Est. Qty. (Two Years)		Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	
<b>7D</b>	<b>Depth 23' - Reach 34' Weight 65,000 lbs.</b>												
9000198	Daily Rate	6	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$725.00	\$4,350.00	\$995.00	\$5,970.00	\$720.00	\$4,320.00	
9000199	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,400.00	\$9,600.00	\$2,700.00	\$10,800.00	\$2,995.00	\$11,980.00	\$2,160.00	\$8,640.00	
9001019	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$6,500.00	\$13,000.00	\$5,500.00	\$11,000.00	\$8,400.00	\$16,800.00	\$6,480.00	\$12,960.00	
9001020	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	24	No Bid	No Bid	\$775.00	\$18,600.00	\$145.00	\$3,480.00	\$358.00	\$8,592.00	\$225.00	\$5,400.00	
9001021	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$775.00	\$1,550.00	\$145.00	\$290.00	\$99.00	\$198.00	\$225.00	\$450.00	
<b>ITEM 8:</b>	<b>Hydraulic Hammer for excavator with:</b>												
<b>8A</b>	<b>1,500 foot pound impact strength</b>												
9001022	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$340.00	\$680.00	\$175.00	\$350.00	\$214.00	\$428.00	
9001023	Weekly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,250.00	\$2,500.00	\$495.00	\$990.00	\$644.00	\$1,288.00	
9001024	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,700.00	\$5,400.00	\$2,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$1,095.00	\$2,190.00	\$1,935.00	\$3,870.00	
9001025	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00	\$4,800.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$198.00	\$2,376.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
9001026	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00	\$800.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$198.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
<b>8B</b>	<b>3,500 foot pound impact strength</b>												
9001027	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$450.00	\$900.00	\$395.00	\$790.00	\$466.00	\$932.00	
9001028	Weekly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,700.00	\$3,400.00	\$1,095.00	\$2,190.00	\$1,399.00	\$2,798.00	
9001029	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,100.00	\$8,200.00	\$3,450.00	\$6,900.00	\$3,295.00	\$6,590.00	\$4,199.00	\$8,398.00	
	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00	\$4,800.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$198.00	\$2,376.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00	\$800.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$198.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
<b>8C</b>	<b>5,000 foot pound impact strength</b>												
9001030	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$790.00	\$1,580.00	\$395.00	\$790.00	\$777.00	\$1,554.00	
9001031	Weekly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,750.00	\$5,500.00	\$1,095.00	\$2,190.00	\$2,332.00	\$4,664.00	
9001032	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,500.00	\$9,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$8,000.00	\$3,295.00	\$6,590.00	\$7,000.00	\$14,000.00	
9001033	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	12	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00	\$4,800.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$198.00	\$2,376.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
9001034	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00	\$800.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$198.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
<b>8D</b>	<b>8,000 foot pound impact strength</b>												
9001035	Daily Rate	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,200.00	\$7,200.00	\$980.00	\$5,880.00	\$832.00	\$4,992.00	
9001036	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,500.00	\$18,000.00	\$2,695.00	\$10,780.00	\$2,499.00	\$9,996.00	
9001037	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$8,500.00	\$17,000.00	\$5,500.00	\$11,000.00	\$6,300.00	\$12,600.00	\$7,499.00	\$14,998.00	
	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	24	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00	\$9,600.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$198.00	\$4,752.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
	Relocation Fee	6	No Bid	No Bid	\$400.00	\$2,400.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$99.00	\$594.00	\$0.00	\$0.00	
<b>Section Total</b>					<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$279,340.00</b>		<b>\$232,690.00</b>		<b>\$274,056.00</b>		<b>\$269,372.00</b>

		BIDDERS										
		Wilson Equipment Company		Rudd Equipment		Wayne Supply Company		Hertz Equipment		CMC		
Description	Est. Qty. (Two Years)	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	
<b>SECTION D</b>												
<b>ITEM 9:</b>	<b>Street Broom (enclosed cab only) - Weight 5,000 lbs., broom 8'</b>											
9001038	Daily Rate	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$170.00	\$1,020.00	\$240.00	\$1,440.00	\$166.00	\$996.00
9001039	Weekly Rate	6	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$600.00	\$3,600.00	\$675.00	\$4,050.00	\$749.00	\$4,494.00
9001040	Monthly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,185.00	\$4,740.00	\$1,325.00	\$5,300.00	\$2,250.00	\$9,000.00
9001041	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	32	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$3,040.00	\$198.00	\$6,336.00	\$100.00	\$3,200.00
9001042	Relocation Fee	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$950.00	\$99.00	\$990.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00
<b>ITEM 10:</b>	<b>Light tower (trailer mounted) portable 4,000 Watts.</b>											
9001043	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.00	\$170.00	\$65.00	\$130.00	\$90.00	\$180.00
9001044	Weekly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	\$390.00	\$165.00	\$330.00	\$275.00	\$550.00
9001045	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$395.00	\$790.00	\$425.00	\$850.00	\$800.00	\$1,600.00
9001046	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$1,140.00	\$198.00	\$2,376.00	\$75.00	\$900.00
9001047	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00	\$190.00	\$99.00	\$198.00	\$75.00	\$150.00
<b>Section Total</b>				<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$16,030.00</b>		<b>\$22,000.00</b>		<b>\$22,070.00</b>
<b>SECTION E</b>												
<b>ITEM 11:</b>	<b>Bulldozers</b>											
<b>11A</b>	<b>Bulldozer CAT (D6 and six way Blade) or equivalent</b>											
9001048	Daily Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$450.00	\$1,800.00	\$760.00	\$3,040.00	No Bid	No Bid
9001049	Weekly Rate	4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,800.00	\$7,200.00	\$2,565.00	\$10,260.00	No Bid	No Bid
9001050	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4,500.00	\$9,000.00	\$6,525.00	\$13,050.00	No Bid	No Bid
9001051	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$145.00	\$2,900.00	\$258.00	\$5,160.00	No Bid	No Bid
9001052	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$145.00	\$290.00	\$99.00	\$198.00	No Bid	No Bid
<b>11B</b>	<b>Bulldozer CAT 953 High Lift Track Loader or equivalent</b>											
9001053	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$550.00	\$1,100.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9001054	Weekly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1,900.00	\$3,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9001055	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$5,300.00	\$10,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9001056	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$145.00	\$1,740.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9001057	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$145.00	\$290.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>11C</b>	<b>Bulldozer CAT 963 High Lift Track Loader or equivalent</b>											
9001058	Daily Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$710.00	\$1,420.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9001059	Weekly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,500.00	\$5,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9001060	Monthly Rate	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$7,000.00	\$14,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9001061	Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee	12	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$145.00	\$1,740.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9001062	Relocation Fee	2	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$145.00	\$290.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>Section Total</b>				<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$61,170.00</b>		<b>\$31,708.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>

**BIDDERS**

Description		Est. Qty. (Two Years)	Wilson Equipment Company		Rudd Equipment		Whayne Supply Company		Hertz Equipment		CMC	
			Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total	Rental Fees	Total
<b>SECTION F</b>												
<b>ITEM 12:</b>	Ditch Witch											
<b>12A</b>	Ditch Witch JT3020 Directional Drilling Rig W/Attachments and fluid system											
	<b>Daily Rate</b>	<b>2</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Weekly Rate</b>	<b>2</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Monthly Rate</b>	<b>2</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee</b>	<b>6</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Relocation Fee</b>	<b>0</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
<b>12B</b>	Ditch Witch JT3020 Directional Drilling Rig W/Attachments and fluid system											
	<b>Drill Rod Replacement</b>	<b>2</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Drill head replacement , each</b>	<b>2</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Back reamer replacement, each</b>	<b>2</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Delivery Fee/Pickup Fee</b>	<b>12</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	<b>Relocation Fee</b>	<b>0</b>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Section Total				<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>
<b>Total Bid</b>			\$0.00		\$309,020.00		\$294,080.00		\$390,304.00		\$291,442.00	
<b>Total Bid Amount of Lines Awarded</b>			<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>		<b>\$0.00</b>	
<b>SECTION G</b>												
<b>Volume Discount</b>												
<b>Discount offered for items not listed on contract</b>			No Bid		10%		30%		0%		10%	