

Preliminary results this does not constitute an award

#	LWC Stock #	Size of Main	Vendor			Ferguson Waterworks		Viking Supply		Fortiline		HD Supply		Hayes Pipe Supply		Mueller Co.	
			O.D. Range	Size of Outlet	2 YEAR Est'd QTY	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost
1	1500064	6"	6.90-7.20	4"	15	\$ 312.74	\$ 4,691.10	\$ 311.00	\$ 4,665.00	\$ 325.58	\$ 4,883.70	\$ 435.55	\$ 6,533.25	\$ 373.74	\$ 5,606.10	\$ 470.18	\$ 7,052.70
2	1500066	6"	6.90-7.20	6"	0	\$ 345.71	\$ -	\$ 361.00	\$ -	\$ 377.39	\$ -	\$ 450.50	\$ -	\$ 454.55	\$ -	\$ 541.36	\$ -
3	1500084	8"	8.99-9.30	4"	100	\$ 336.91	\$ 33,691.00	\$ 342.00	\$ 34,200.00	\$ 355.55	\$ 35,555.00	\$ 446.03	\$ 44,603.00	\$ 404.04	\$ 40,404.00	\$ 484.45	\$ 48,445.00
4	1500086	8"	8.99-9.30	6"	50	\$ 367.27	\$ 18,363.50	\$ 391.00	\$ 19,550.00	\$ 406.27	\$ 20,313.50	\$ 483.01	\$ 24,150.50	\$ 479.80	\$ 23,990.00	\$ 512.24	\$ 25,612.00
5	1500088	8"	8.99-9.30	8"	0	\$ 476.76	\$ -	\$ 448.00	\$ -	\$ 467.85	\$ -	\$ 594.00	\$ -	\$ 681.82	\$ -	\$ 747.02	\$ -
6	1500108	10"	11.10-11.40	8"	0	\$ 520.97	\$ -	\$ 503.00	\$ -	\$ 525.25	\$ -	\$ 681.00	\$ -	\$ 747.47	\$ -	\$ 774.67	\$ -
7	1501204	12"	13.20-13.50	4"	15	\$ 429.91	\$ 6,448.65	\$ 413.00	\$ 6,195.00	\$ 430.47	\$ 6,457.05	\$ 571.37	\$ 8,570.55	\$ 429.29	\$ 6,439.35	\$ 635.91	\$ 9,538.65
8	1501206	12"	13.20-13.50	6"	8	\$ 425.16	\$ 3,401.28	\$ 458.00	\$ 3,664.00	\$ 478.99	\$ 3,831.92	\$ 632.69	\$ 5,061.52	\$ 530.30	\$ 4,242.40	\$ 641.39	\$ 5,131.12
9	1501208	12"	13.20-13.50	8"	40	\$ 550.80	\$ 22,032.00	\$ 529.00	\$ 21,160.00	\$ 552.59	\$ 22,103.60	\$ 774.55	\$ 30,982.00	\$ 757.58	\$ 30,303.20	\$ 852.15	\$ 34,086.00
10	1501210	12"	13.20-13.50	10"	2	\$ 711.84	\$ 1,423.68	\$ 687.00	\$ 1,374.00	\$ 717.41	\$ 1,434.82	\$ 1,013.05	\$ 2,026.10	\$ 898.99	\$ 1,797.98	\$ 1,174.97	\$ 2,349.94
11	1501212	12"	13.20-13.50	12"	0	\$ 895.36	\$ -	\$ 955.00	\$ -	\$ 997.50	\$ -	\$ 1,132.00	\$ -	\$ 1,111.11	\$ -	\$ 1,570.50	\$ -
12	1501604	16"	17.40-17.80	4"	3	\$ 492.68	\$ 1,478.04	\$ 545.00	\$ 1,635.00	\$ 569.00	\$ 1,707.00	\$ 807.46	\$ 2,422.38	\$ 606.06	\$ 1,818.18	\$ 722.15	\$ 2,166.45
13	1501606	16"	17.40-17.80	6"	20	\$ 547.40	\$ 10,948.00	\$ 568.00	\$ 11,360.00	\$ 593.23	\$ 11,864.60	\$ 908.41	\$ 18,168.20	\$ 656.57	\$ 13,131.40	\$ 834.03	\$ 16,680.60
14	1501608	16"	17.40-17.80	8"	4	\$ 625.44	\$ 2,501.76	\$ 654.00	\$ 2,616.00	\$ 682.68	\$ 2,730.72	\$ 992.61	\$ 3,970.44	\$ 909.09	\$ 3,636.36	\$ 962.21	\$ 3,848.84
15	1501613	16"	17.40-17.80	12"	0	\$ 1,041.35	\$ -	\$ 1,239.00	\$ -	\$ 1,293.19	\$ -	\$ 1,372.00	\$ -	\$ 1,414.14	\$ -	\$ 1,846.53	\$ -
16	1504206	20"	21.60-22.06	6"	0	\$ 579.79	\$ -	\$ 823.00	\$ -	\$ 859.35	\$ -	\$ 1,002.00	\$ -	\$ 696.97	\$ -	\$ 795.39	\$ -
17	1502008	20"	21.60-22.06	8"	0	\$ 819.06	\$ -	\$ 858.00	\$ -	\$ 895.54	\$ -	\$ 1,070.00	\$ -	\$ 1,262.63	\$ -	\$ 1,040.19	\$ -
18	1502112	20"	21.60-22.06	12"	0	\$ 1,290.67	\$ -	\$ 1,341.00	\$ -	\$ 1,399.76	\$ -	\$ 1,610.00	\$ -	\$ 1,616.16	\$ -	\$ 1,968.89	\$ -
19	1502016	20"	21.60-22.06	16"	2	\$ 3,012.83	\$ 6,025.66	\$ 1,818.00	\$ 3,636.00	\$ 1,910.00	\$ 3,820.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 2,575.76	\$ 5,151.52	\$ -	\$ -
20	1502406	24"	25.80-26.32	6"	0	\$ 607.85	\$ -	\$ 794.00	\$ -	\$ 829.26	\$ -	\$ 1,033.00	\$ -	\$ 808.08	\$ -	\$ 1,217.38	\$ -
21	1503132	30"	32.00-32.40	12"	0	\$ 2,012.19	\$ -	\$ 2,233.00	\$ -	\$ 2,355.60	\$ -	\$ 3,300.00	\$ -	\$ 2,280.81	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -
458														\$ -	\$ -		
Item #	LWC Stock #	Size of Main	O.D. Range	Size of Outlet		Unit Cost	Total Cost			Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost	Unit Cost	Total Cost
22	1503066	6"	6.91-7.40	6"	0	\$ 332.90	\$ -	\$ 361.00	\$ -	\$ 377.39	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ 454.55	\$ -	\$ 541.36	\$ -
23	1503086	8"	9.11-9.68	6"	0	\$ 367.27	\$ -	\$ 391.00	\$ -	\$ 408.27	\$ -	NO BID	\$ -	\$ 479.80	\$ -	\$ 563.46	\$ -

Bid Opened October 29, 2014

14-130/ Tapping Sleeves with MJ Outlets

Buyer: David W. Collier

Preliminary results this does not constitute an award

24	1503088	8"	9.11-9.68	8"	0	\$ 476.76	\$ -	\$ 448.00	\$ -	\$ 467.85	\$ -	NO BID		\$ 681.82	\$ -	\$ 747.02	\$ -
25	1503106	10"	11.24-12.24	6"	0	\$ 385.97	\$ -	\$ 475.00	\$ -	\$ 496.56	\$ -	NO BID		\$ 530.30	\$ -	\$ 591.91	\$ -
26	1503108	10"	11.24-12.24	8"	0	\$ 527.40	\$ -	\$ 503.00	\$ -	\$ 525.25	\$ -	NO BID		\$ 747.47	\$ -	\$ 774.67	\$ -
27	1503128	12"	13.44-14.20	8"	0	\$ 564.92	\$ -	\$ 529.00	\$ -	\$ 552.59	\$ -	NO BID		\$ 757.58	\$ -	\$ 865.22	\$ -
Total						\$ 111,004.67		\$ 110,055.00	\$ 114,701.91	\$ 146,487.94	\$ 136,520.49	\$ 154,911.30					
Delivery																	
Manufacturer																	
Total Awarded						\$ 70,383.58		\$ 37,030.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -					

Bid Opened October 29, 2014

14-130/ Tapping Sleeves with MJ Outlets

Buyer: David W. Collier

Preliminary results this does not constitute an award

27	1503128	12"	13.44-14.20	8"	0															
						Total														
						Delivery														
						Manufacturer														
						Total Awarded	\$	-			\$	-	\$	-	\$	-	\$	-		

Apparent Low Bidders:
Plan holders not submitting bids:
Plan holders submitting No Bid: none