

BID 16-126 / Contingency Contract for Pump Repairs
 Bid Opening: September 21, 2016
 Project Manager's
 Estimate \$70,000 (2 Years)

Awardees: Layne Christensen Co., RPM, Inc., & Mohler Technology, Inc.
 Buyer: Robin Heitz
 Project Manager: John Azzara

		Layne Christensen Company		RPM, Inc.		Mohler Technology, Inc.		Krauth Electric Co.		Evans Construction Co., Inc. [1]	
	Est'd Hours (2 years)	Hourly Rate	Total	Hourly Rate	Total	Hourly Rate	Total	Hourly Rate	Total	Hourly Rate	Total
Field Labor Rate	200	\$70.00	\$14,000.00	\$98.29	\$19,658.00	\$94.00	\$18,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$49.30	\$9,860.00
Overtime Field Labor Rate	50	\$105.00	\$5,250.00	\$147.44	\$7,372.00	\$131.60	\$6,580.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$73.95	\$3,697.50
Shop Labor Rate	400	\$75.00	\$30,000.00	\$68.98	\$27,592.00	\$92.00	\$36,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$47.85	\$19,140.00
Overtime Shop Labor Rate	50	\$112.50	\$5,625.00	\$103.48	\$5,174.00	\$128.80	\$6,440.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$71.78	\$3,589.00
Materials & Parts (% Markup)		20%		20%		20%		NO BID	NO BID	14%	
Pump Specialization: Centrifugal and/or Vertical Turbine		Both		Both		Both		NO BID	NO BID	Both	
Total Cost (2 years)		\$54,875.00		\$59,796.00		\$68,620.00		NO BID	NO BID	\$36,286.50	
Bid Signed:		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	

Planholders not submitting a bid: Blackhaq Enterprises, D&F Distributors, and McGraw-Hill.

[1] Bidder disqualified, deemed non-responsive. Did not meet qualifications outlined in the specifications. As required in our specifications, they have not repaired, replaced, installed, and adjusted the following for at least the past three consecutive years for at least four different companies; pumps ranging from 480 volts to 13,800 volts. They only have one customer for pump repairs.

Contract period: November 1, 2016 to October 31, 2021