

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
 Bid 15-168 / Stone, Soil, Mfg Sand, and
 Coarse Concrete Sand (Specified Backfill Sand)
 Bid Opening: December 16, 2015

Buyer: Renee Fromme

SECTION A - Stone				Quality Stone		Nugent Sand Company		Terry Gollar Trucking Inc.	
Item No.	Service Description	Estimated Quantity in Tons/1 year	Previous Price	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost
1	Kentucky # 3 or Indiana # 2	3,300	\$6.00	\$8.75	\$28,875.00	\$11.40	\$37,620.00	\$9.78	\$32,274.00
2	Kentucky # 57 or Indiana # 8	19,000	\$7.00	\$12.00	\$228,000.00	\$11.40	\$216,600.00	\$12.42	\$235,980.00
3	Kentucky #9 or Indiana 3/8" pea	500	\$7.00	\$12.25	\$6,125.00	\$11.40	\$5,700.00	\$14.28	\$7,140.00
4	Kentucky DGA or Indiana #73	5,500	\$4.70	\$8.75	\$48,125.00	\$11.40	\$62,700.00	\$9.78	\$53,790.00
SUBTOTAL/STONE					\$311,125.00		\$322,620.00		\$329,184.00

SECTION B - Soil				Quality Stone		Nugent Sand Company		Terry Gollar Trucking Inc.	
Item No.	Service Description	Estimated Quantity in tons/1 year	Previous Price	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost
5	Processed Top Soil	7,300	\$20.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00
SUBTOTAL/SOIL					\$0.00		\$0.00		\$0.00

SECTION C - Mfg Sand				Quality Stone		Nugent Sand Company		Terry Gollar Trucking Inc.	
Item No.	Service Description	Estimated Quantity in tons/1 year	Previous Price	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost
6	3/8" Kentucky Manufactured Sand or Indiana equivalent	6,200	\$4.75	\$8.00	\$49,600.00	No Bid	\$0.00	\$7.92	\$49,104.00
SUBTOTAL.SAND					\$49,600.00		\$0.00		\$49,104.00

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
 Bid 15-168 / Stone, Soil, Mfg Sand, and
 Coarse Concrete Sand (Specified Backfill Sand)
 Bid Opening: December 16, 2015

Buyer: Renee Fromme

SECTION D - Course Concrete Sand (Specified Backfill Sand), Mortar & Backfill Sand				Quality Stone		Nugent Sand Company		Terry Gollar Trucking Inc.	
Item No.	Service Description	Estimated Quantity in tons/1 year	Previous Price	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost
7	Course Concrete Sand (Specified Backfill Sand)	2,500	\$8.25	\$14.00	\$35,000.00	\$9.15	\$22,875.00	No Bid	\$0.00
SUBTOTAL/ Course Concrete Sand (Specified Backfill Sand)					\$35,000.00		\$22,875.00		\$0.00

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
 Bid 15-168 / Stone, Soil, Mfg Sand, and
 Coarse Concrete Sand (Specified Backfill Sand)
 Bid Opening: December 16, 2015

Buyer: Renee Fromme

SECTION E - Deliveries				Quality Stone		Nugent Sand Company		Terry Gollar Trucking Inc.	
Item No.	Service Description/Delivery cost per load for each location	Estimated Number of Deliveries/1 year	Previous Price	Bid Price (per ton)	Total Cost	Bid Price Per Load Delivered*	Total Cost	Bid Price Per Load Delivered*	Total Cost
8	Allmond Avenue Facility, Regular Hours (Stone/Sand)	550	\$89.00	\$110.00	\$60,500.00	\$90.00	\$49,500.00	\$100.00	\$55,000.00
9	Allmond Avenue Facility, After Hours, Holidays, Weekends (Stone, Sand)	5	\$89.00	\$160.00	\$800.00	\$100.00	\$500.00	No Bid	\$0.00
10	Middletown Substation Facility, Regular Hours (Stone, Sand)	50	\$100.00	\$150.00	\$7,500.00	\$100.00	\$5,000.00	No Bid	\$0.00
11	Middletown Substation Facility, After Hours, Holidays, Weekends (Stone, Sand)	5	\$128.00	\$200.00	\$1,000.00	\$120.00	\$600.00	No Bid	\$0.00
12	Allmond Avenue Facility, Regular Hours(Course Concrete Sand/ Specified Backfill Sand, Mortar & Backfill Sand)	105	\$90.00	\$110.00	\$11,550.00	\$90.00	\$9,450.00	No Bid	\$0.00
13	Allmond Avenue Facility, After Hours, Holidays, Weekends (Course Concrete Sand/ Specified Backfill Sand, Mortar & Backfill Sand)	2	\$150.00	\$160.00	\$320.00	\$100.00	\$200.00	No Bid	\$0.00
14	Job Sites, Regular Hours (Stone, Sand)	450	\$125.00	\$125.00	\$56,250.00	\$130.00	\$58,500.00	No Bid	\$0.00
15	Job Sites, After Hours, Weekends, Holidays (Stone, Sand)	5	\$130.00	\$175.00	\$875.00	\$130.00	\$650.00	No Bid	\$0.00

LOUISVILLE WATER COMPANY
 Bid 15-168 / Stone, Soil, Mfg Sand, and
 Coarse Concrete Sand (Specified Backfill Sand)
 Bid Opening: December 16, 2015

16	Allmond Avenue Facility, Regular Hours (Soil)	125	\$130.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00
17	Allmond Avenue Facility, After Hours, Holidays, Weekends (Soil)	2	\$170.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00
18	Middletown Substation Facility, Regular Hours (Soil)	35	\$160.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00
19	Middletown Substation Facility, After Hours, Holidays, Weekends (Soil)	2	\$200.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00
20	Job Sites, Regular Hours (Soil)	50	\$210.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00
21	Job Sites, After Hours, Weekends, Holidays (Soil)	2	\$250.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00	No Bid	\$0.00
SUBTOTAL DELIVERIES					\$138,795.00		\$124,400.00		\$55,000.00
GRAND TOTAL					\$499,520.00		\$469,895.00		\$384,184.00
Amount Awarded									